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Overview:
Love Golf?

Then you probably have a pile of golf logs lying in a drawer somewhere
already. Why not use a golf log book so you can have every game you play at
your fingertips. You can track putts, strokes, bunkers, best shots and pretty
much anything else you want to know with this journal.

By tracking your results on each hole, you can see how much better you are
playing (or worse!) and then crush your friends the next time you play a
round. Make secret notes about hole seven or blame your score on the wind
that day.

No matter what your log book has you covered.

Scroll up and grab your copy by hitting the orange buy button today!
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Additional Information:

 

About My Golfing Log Book
 Blank Book Billionaire is the creative force behind many different types of
blank books or utility books as some people call them. They focus on creating
books that help people express themselves or simply keep track of things. The
sky is the limit for what you can create with these blank books. Not all the
books are blank, of course. There are lined journals, gratitude journals, travel
journals, pregnancy journals and many others. Some have prompts while
others have sections that are designated for specific information. Our mission
is to provide you with every type of blank book you might need. If they don't
have it now, they will soon. Journaling is their passion and hope to inspire
people to make it a part of their daily life. Essentially journaling to them is the
act of writing down everything a person wants to remember or reference back
to. Whether that is emotions, life events, recipes, pregnancies or your to do
list, writing it down is the most powerful way of ensuring it never gets
forgotten. What you can do with a blank book is only limited by the amount of
imagination you put into it. Make it a diary, a meal planner, a diet journal or
just doodle in it. The point is to get one or seven and use them. Make life
easier by unleashing the hidden power of a blank book.
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